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2019 DHS Fall Activities Senior Night Featuring Maci Rauls

Dexter, Missouri - The DHS Fall Activities Senior Night was held at Charles Bland
Stadium on Friday, October 25, 2019 prior to the start of the Malden vs Dexter football
game.

Maci Rauls is the daughter of Stacy and Rick Rauls.

She is a member of the DHS Football Cheer team.

Her future plans are to obtain a business administration degree.

Her most memorable moment ?is when Sydnie McMillion fell at the pep rally junior year
?.
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2019 DHS Fall Activities Senior Night Featuring Delaney Lemmon

Dexter, Missouri - The DHS Fall Activities Senior Night was held at Charles Bland
Stadium on Friday, October 24, 2019 prior to the start of the Malden vs Dexter football
game.

Delaney Lemmon is the daughter of Shannon and JJ Lemmon .

She is a member of the DHS Football Cheer team.

Her future plans are to attend ?Southwest Baptist University and get her degree in
Children’s Ministry

Her most memorable moment is ?getting the opportunity to cheer on the best boys while
cheering on the sidelines with my best friend, Maci Rauls.
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2019 DHS Fall Activities Senior Night Featuring Madilyn Hampton

Dexter, Missouri - The DHS Fall Activities Senior Night was held at Charles Bland
Stadium on Friday, October 25, 2019 prior to the start of the Malden vs Dexter football
game.

Madilyn Hampton is the daughter of Jennifer and Tom Hampton.

She is a member of the DHS Football Cheer team.

Madilyn plans to attend ?University of Missouri and major in Biology-Pre Medicine?.

Her most memorable moment is ?making funny Tik Toks with the team before games.
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2019 DHS Fall Activities Senior Night Featuring Maddie Slaton

Dexter, Missouri - The DHS Fall Activities Senior Night was held at Charles Bland
Stadium on Friday, October 25, 2019 prior to the start of the Malden vs Dexter football
game.

Maddie Slaton is the daughter of Patricia and Wesley Slaton.

She is a member of the DHS Cross Country Team.

Maddie plans to attend ?SEMO in the fall and major in Psychology. After that I plan to
become a Psychiatrist.
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Her most memorable moment is ?anything that involved Coach Morse. He pours his heart
out into every runner and is an inspiration to all. He inspires me everyday to work harder
and to me by true self. I am going to miss him terribly when I go off to college. Love you
Coach Morse!
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2019 DHS Fall Activities Senior Night Featuring AnnMarie Slaton

Dexter, Missouri - The DHS Fall Activities Senior Night was held at Charles Bland
Stadium on Friday, October 25, 2019 prior to the start of the Malden vs Dexter football
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game.

AnnMarie Slaton is the daughter of Patricia and Wesley Slaton.

AnnMarie is a member of the DHS Marching Band.

AnnMarie plans to attend ?Southeast Missouri State University and double major in
Elementary Education and Business with hopes of owning and running a daycare for my
church community.

Her most memorable moment at DHS was ?getting a concussion because Benji hit her in
the head with his trombone while setting drill.
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